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Using an Enterprise 1 and Comms Pack, 
and connecting to Prestel (free enclosed 
application form) via your computer, you 
would be able to down load 1000's of free 
Programs which include Games (play a 
different game every day), Utilities and 
Business Software. 

For the business user, Telex and 
Electronic Mail will ensure speedy 
transfer of important business information 
in addition you can book Holidays, Hotels, 
Plane, Rail, Theatre and Bus Tickets. 
You have the same equipment as the 
Travel Agent. The Enterprise also gives 
you Home Banking and Home Tele 
Shopping, you can even buy Stocks and 
Shares and check Market Trends, from 
the comfort of you own arm chair. 

Talk to the world via your own Mail Box on 
the popular Micronet and Prestel Data 
Bases. Be in touch with the latest 
information and reviews. 

This and much more is offered by the 
exciting World of Comms. 

Full details available from: 
Kirk Automation 

Bridge Works 
St. Whites Road 

Cinderford 
Glos. 

Tel: (0594) 22084 

Your Dealer is: 


